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Senator Nangle, Representative Crafts and Esteemed Members of the Joint Standing 
Committee on Transportation, I am Mathew McIntyre and I humbly serve as the 
Representative for Maine’s House District 18 comprising 16 towns and four Unorganized 
Territories spanning portions of Penobscot, Hancock and Washington counties. Today I 
offer testimony as the sponsor of LD1562, “An Act Regarding Municipal Road 
Standards”. 

As I begin, I offer my presentation today is a direct result of engaging with Town Boards 
and County Commissioners throughout District 18, and I serve proudly in carrying their 
voices here for your respectful consideration. 

Per Maine Revised Statutes Title 23, Part 3, Chapter 313, Subsection 3651 (Failure to 
provide safety and convenience), “Highways, town ways and streets legally established 
shall be open and kept in repair so as to be safe and convenient for travelers with 
motor vehicles…”.  If we were to ask 100 different roadway travelers to define “safe and 
convenient”, I suggest we would likely receive just as many interpretations, especially 
when we account for Maine’s infamous fifth season… “Mud Season”.  This broad and 
enigmatic language alone represents a problem that multiple Town Boards across District 
18, and in fact the State regularly grapple with. 

The first objective of this proposed Act is intended to inject a bit of our State’s notable 
common-sense into Subsection 3651, by granting those municipal authorities responsible 
for road maintenance of Town ways a measure of reasonable latitude in their response 
plans dependent upon (1) the type of roadway (paved versus gravel) and (2) the time of 
the year.  Additionally, a desired objective is to ensure that municipal authorities have 
access to codified statutory language which correctly identifies the Maine State 
Department of Transportation (MDOT) as the rightful and logical authority of associated 
subject matter expertise for defining and potentially adjudicating “safe and convenient”.  
This is clearly supported by the existence of two paid staff positions within MDOT that 
not many outside of this committee are likely familiar with; the Maine State “Road 
Ranger” and “Bridge Ranger”.  Additionally, I draw your attention to the defined function 
of the Maine Local Roads Center, as published on the MDOT website; “The Maine 
Local Roads Center provides training, technical assistance, and information to those 
municipal and county personnel who are responsible for constructing, maintaining, 
and managing local roads and bridges in Maine”. 
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Before I continue, I feel it is equally important that I affirm what this Act is NOT 
designed to achieve.  This Act is not intended to alleviate Towns from their responsibility 
to address identified “defects” on the roadways they are legally required to maintain, nor 
is it intended to deny a pathway for a citizen to register a complaint.  It is very important 
to me that we ensure roadway travelers are always guaranteed due-process to allow for 
defects to be reported, acknowledged, evaluated by subject matter experts and ultimately 
addressed in a fashion which complies with defined standards. 

To now speak to the second component of this proposed Act, the suggested repeal of 
Subsections 3652, 3653 and 3654.  Through research conducted by our Law Library, it 
has been determined at least one of these subsections was originally enacted in 1849 
during the 58th Legislature, predating the 1972 establishment of the Department of 
Transportation by approximately 123 years.  Of interesting note, subsection 3652 
(“Notice of defect; hearing on petition”) was indeed amended once, in 1949 by the 94th 
Legislature, to inject language pertaining to the then modern marvel of “motor vehicles”.  
Prior to that, the subsection revolved around “horses, teams and carriages”.   

Given the proposed clarifying language to be added to subsection 3651, and in the 
interest of improving petition process efficiency by eliminating unnecessary bureaucracy 
directly resulting from what is clearly an extremely outdated law, it is suggested that 
subsections 3652 through 3654 be repealed in full and replaced by simple MDOT policy.  
The Maine Department of Transportation is the State’s recognized subject matter expert 
for road standards, not County Commissioners and not Town Councils or Boards of 
Select. 

With your support of these common-sense updates, we have an opportunity to solve 
several existing process-related problems at one time, while ensuring that constituents 
rightfully maintain a pathway for redress of their concerns. 

I thank you for your time today, and look forward to contributing to the conversation 
during future work sessions, should the committee feel additional input is warranted.  I 
will be glad to address any questions you may now have. 

 


